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Please briefly present the partner organisation. 

BACKGROUND AND EXPERIENCE

Hevsel Women, Family and Youth Association is a social aid association that supports social transformation 
in the fields of women, family and youth and aims to raise awareness in these areas. The main goal of our 
association is to raise awareness on critical issues such as gender inequality, domestic violence, education 
and employment and to raise awareness in society on these issues. Our association organizes various 
projects and events to ensure that women are socially, economically and culturally empowered. These 
studies support women's leadership capacities and their more active participation in decision-making 
processes.

In addition, supporting the development of young people, providing resources to individuals with limited 
opportunities in the field of sports and keeping young people away from harmful habits are among our 
priorities. We organize sports activities and education programs so that young people can live a healthy life 
and maximize their potential. We aim to integrate young people into social life and develop a sense of social 
responsibility through art, culture and sports events.

Our association actively participates in national and international projects and carries out various studies 
in order to support young people with limited opportunities and to ensure the adoption and dissemination 
of sports. In particular, we carry out youth exchange programs and education projects by establishing 
international partnerships. Our important activities include organizing campaigns on disaster awareness 
and supporting the participation of individuals with special needs in activities in the fields of music, art and 
sports. These activities aim to increase social solidarity and social resilience in crisis situations.
In addition, our association carries out activities aimed at creating social awareness on human rights, 
children's rights and women's rights. We organize activities to raise public awareness on these issues and 
support social change through educational seminars and workshops. We promote a lifestyle in harmony 
with nature by carrying out projects on spreading environmental protection awareness and encouraging 
nature-friendly practices. Within this framework, social contributions are made through initiatives such as 
the protection of green areas and sustainable agriculture projects.

Our association's expert team has extensive experience in areas such as youth work, women's rights and 
family support, from project management to education and workshops. Our team works together with 
various experts, including psychologists, social workers, sports trainers and lawyers, to ensure that 
effective projects are implemented. We help women and families overcome the difficulties they experience 
by providing psychological and social counseling services. We also provide leadership, communication and 
career planning training to support young people's professional and personal development.

Each member of our team is specialized in creating social awareness and supporting society, and has 
important skills in designing projects that will integrate young people into social life. Our association aims 
to raise young people not only as consumers but also as individuals who contribute to society. In this 
context, we encourage young people to participate in social entrepreneurship projects, allowing them to 
develop their creativity and problem-solving skills.



What are the activities and experience of the organisation in the areas relevant for this 
application?

All these efforts are carried out to make society more conscious and focused on solidarity. Hevsel Women 
Family and Youth Association aims to play a leading role in spreading social solidarity and equality and 
carries out its projects with this vision. Our long-term goals include ensuring gender equality, increasing 
educational opportunities and contributing to sustainable development. Our association encourages 
voluntary participation and invites all segments of society to work together for a better future.

Our association carries out various activities in order to support social transformation in the fields of 
women, family and youth. In this context, it organizes seminars, panels and training programs to raise 
awareness on gender inequality. Priority is given to projects that encourage women's participation in social 
and economic life and to work on developing their leadership skills. In addition, we aim to strengthen 
families by providing guidance and support services in order to prevent domestic violence and increase 
awareness.

In the field of youth, we carry out awareness-raising activities on education and employment in order to 
support the development of young people. Trainings are organized to develop young people's leadership, 
communication and career planning skills, and projects are carried out to encourage their active 
participation in social life. We encourage creativity by organizing entrepreneurship and innovation trainings 
for young people, thus enabling them to produce new ideas and contribute to society.

In the field of sports, we organize activities in different sports branches to support young people with 
limited opportunities and encourage young people to do sports. The sports tournaments and events 
organized improve the physical health of young people, while also increasing their self-confidence and 
helping them gain social skills.

Our association organizes various programs to ensure that young people stay away from harmful habits and 
conducts studies on disaster awareness. Disaster preparedness seminars and trainings have an important 
place in increasing social resilience. Supporting individuals with special needs in the fields of music, art and 
sports is also one of the association's areas of activity. In this way, we aim to reach every segment of 
society and ensure social inclusion. 

The association, which organizes awareness studies on issues such as human rights, children's rights and 
women's rights, also makes efforts to promote environmental protection and nature-friendly practices in 
society. In this context, it develops various projects and aims to contribute to social transformation by 
implementing environmental awareness-raising activities and nature protection projects. In addition, we 
organize trainings on the use of environmentally friendly energy sources and sustainable lifestyles, and 
encourage society to live an environmentally sensitive life.



What are the skills and expertise of key staff/persons involved in this application?

Müzeyyen Kaya - Legal Representative

Our Association President Müzeyyen Kaya is a successful activist who has a Bachelor's degree in Sociology and 

actively participates in civil society activities in Diyarbakır and takes part in various organizations. She plays an 

important role in the fight against addiction as a board member of the Diyarbakır Yeşilay Society. She has 

contributed to young business people and women's entrepreneurship by serving as a board member in 

organizations such as the Southeastern Young Businessmen Association (GÜNGİAD) and the Diyarbakır Business 

Women's Association (DİKAD). At the same time, she supports women's participation in the business world by 

serving as the president of the Hevsel Women's Initiative and Business Administration.

Project Coordinator

This person, who is a member of the Association's Board of Directors, has a Bachelor's degree in Public 

Administration. She has carried out projects in the fields of individuals with special needs and young women's 

entrepreneurship and works in the field of R&D and project coordination in our association.

Project Consultant

Our Project Consultant has experience in projects and is experienced in fund applications, budget management 

and strategic partnership development in Erasmus+ projects. She has project reporting, evaluation and risk 

management skills. At the same time, she has organized various workshops and seminars to increase community 

participation and has deep knowledge in measuring the impact of educational programs. She contributes to the 

successful implementation of projects with her problem-solving ability and creative thinking skills.

Education Specialist

Our Education Specialist is an expert in the personal development of young people, career planning and 

leadership trainings. She is competent in managing group dynamics, establishing effective communication and 

applying participant-centered educational methods. She ensures the active participation of participants in the 

educational processes with her empathy and motivation skills. At the same time, she works to increase the 

psychological resilience of young people with her experience in developing and implementing post-traumatic 

support programs.

The key people in our association have the following skills and expertise:

Our association also has international project experience. We actively participate in projects supported by 
the European Union and other international funds and cooperate with partners from different countries. 
These projects include youth exchange programs and cultural interaction activities, thus allowing 
participants to expand their cultural understanding and establish international connections.

With this experience and activities, our association aims to create a sustainable impact by providing 
widespread support to society. Our projects are shaped with an inclusive and integrative approach by 
encouraging voluntary participation and all segments of society. In the long term, we continue our work to 
strengthen social solidarity and create a more conscious society.



1. Project Management: We have experienced and talented volunteers in planning, implementing and 

monitoring projects.

2. Field Expertise: We have members with expertise and deep knowledge in issues such as women's rights, 

children's rights, youth work, human rights.

3. Education and Consultancy: We have experienced volunteers in organizing educational programs, raising 

awareness and providing consultancy services.

4. Communication and Relationship Management: We have entrepreneurial women members who are able to 

establish strong communication with the society, manage relationships with partners and are successful in using 

social media.

5. Social Guidance and Support: We have team members who can empathize with young people, women and 

disadvantaged groups, and provide guidance and support.

6. Environmental and Nature Awareness: We have members who have knowledge and expertise in 

environmental protection, sustainability and nature-friendly practices.

7. Social Connections and Networking: We have volunteers who have strong connections in the society, who can 

cooperate and create networks.

These skills and expertise ensure that projects are successfully carried out in accordance with the fields of 

activity and goals of our association and that comprehensive services are provided to the society.
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